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IMPORTANT CIRCULAR    12th June 2018 
 
 

To: Dy.R.G.M., A.R.G.Ms.&the Brethren/Companions of the Western Region; 
 

Dear Brother / Companion, 
 
Fraternal Greetings to you all, 
 
It is with regret and pain to inform you that two disgruntled and misguided brethren have 
initiated two separate legal actions in the Court of Junior Civil Judge, City Civil Court at 
Hyderabad on frivolous ground with malafide intention to stall the Grand Festival and 
Installation of beloved Grand Master -Elect, R.W.Bro. Rajeev R. Khandelwal, O.S.M., on 24th / 
25th November 2018 at Nagpur. The matter was intentionally moved before the Vacation Judge 
and Ex-parte Order was obtained restraining the Grand Lodge of India for holding Grand 
Festival and Installation and Investiture Meeting at Nagpur on 24th / 25th November 2018.  All 
efforts are being made to vacate the said Order. 
 
This appears to be a part of a larger conspiracy to create a disharmony and hatred amongst 
the Brethren which is against the basic principal of Freemasonry. This will not only disturb the 
Brotherly love and affection amongst the brethren in India but it will have a far reaching 
consequences and repercussions for the foreign dignitaries who have been invited to witness 
these ceremonies.  No doubt the case will be defended by efficient and Senior Lawyers and all 
efforts will be made to maintain the democratic process of change of guard.  
 
I therefore appeal all the Brethren / Companions, not to indulge or contemplate or to be a party 
either directly or indirectly to any such unthoughtful, irresponsible and insidious action at least 
from the Western Region. If the above is not adhere to, then a strict and appropriate 
disciplinary action in accordance with our Books of Constitution and Bye-laws of our Region 
will be initiated against them.  
 
I am confident that at this critical moment Brethren / Companions of Western Region will unite 
and stand together to defeat any attempt by disgruntled and misguided brethren to disturb the 
democratic process for their vested interest.  
 
With warm fraternal regards, 

Sd/- 

R.W.Bro. M. S. Federal / M.E.Comp. M. S. Federal 
Regional Grand Master / Grand Superintendent 
Regional Grand Lodge /Chapter/ Mark of Western India 
  


